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ABSTRACT: 
 
South African communities are constantly being developed through new ICT 
projects and technologies which are initiated by individuals, government and 
private organisations. The problem with these developments is that they are 
implemented in isolation. This isolation causes limited sharing of resources, 
duplication, poor-governance of the resources, and in worse-case scenarios, 
failure of these projects is realised before their intended purposes. The smart 
community centre model that could be used to address these problems by 
focusing on the Siyabuswa Educational Improvement and Development Trust 
(SEIDET) community centre for experimentation purposes has been proposed. 
This model followed a descriptive analysis of ICT related work spanning over 
two decades performed within the SEIDET context, including the ongoing 
SEIDET Digital Village. The benefits of this smart community centre model 
include community and rural development through sharing of scarce ICT 
resources. It could further provide support for entrepreneurs through training 
interventions, action-based research for policy development as well as spawn 
local innovation and free-sharing of resources and services. This model can 
further be adapted to any local community, as it is designed using the 
international studies and theories. This paper presents the design of the smart 
community centre model. The design is described using Practice Theory 
concepts towards an empirical study that will be conducted using the General 
Morphological Analysis methods to corroborate aspects of practices. The 
scenario of how these theories could be practiced within the SEIDET centre is 
also presented. 

 


